
case # Parcel Name Address City Appraisal Tax Sale Terms Sale Date Purchaser Amount
19CI0351 031-00000327-04 Dong, David 34634 CR 402 Warsaw $12,000.00 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Nolan Miller $20,100.00
2019CI0359 043-00004192-00 Slaughter, Steven G 326 Hamilton Ave Coshocton $45,000.00 4/10/2020 & 4/24/2020 Withdrawn
2019CI0363 035-00000262-00 Hough, Jeremy L & Randles, Chris ( Del Tax)2172 S 9th St Coshocton $2,484.52 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 James Hough Brenda $4,300.00
2019CI0298 043-00001907-00 Ribble, Jason M 616 Main St Coshocton $48,000.00 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Plaintiff $32,000.00

2019CI0063 002-00000096-01 Osborne, Matthew Steven 27843 TR 241 Newcomerstown $33,000.00 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Withdrawn
2019CI0362 018-00000579-31 Snyder, Matthew 52939 TR 159 West Lafayette $12,000.00 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Plaintiff $16,000.00
2019CI0431 002-00000484-01 Hough, Roger L. (Del Tax) 25247/25143 TR 249Fresno $3,346.90 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Randy Landis $7,500.00
2020CI075 017-00000520-00 Warren, Larry L (Del Tax) 27516 TR 199 Fresno $7,225.41 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Withdrawn
2019CI0446 043-00000822-00 Garry & Larry Thurman (Del Tax) 940 S 6th St Coshocton $4,152.46 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Jodi St Clair $12,500.00
2019CI0287 010001-1-7 Starner, Jerome (Mobile home only) (Del Tax)18170 TR 284 Coshocton $2,251.74 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 no bid/no bid
2016CI0172 031-00000120-00 Estep, Virginia L. (Del Tax) 19004 TR 411 Warsaw $25,420.74 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Avery Holdings LLC $55,000.00
2018CI0405 043-00001735-00 Braxton, Nichole R. (Del Tax) 381 S 9th St Coshocton $3,182.76 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 no bid/ no bid
2019CI0347 035-00000781-01 Richardson, Yvonne L (Del Tax) West Canal St Coshocton $1,570.86 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Withdrawn
2019CI0347 035-00000757-00 Richardson, Yvonne L (Del Tax) 333 W Canal St Coshocton $2,585.54 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Withdrawn
2019CI0364 035001-4-0 Hough, Jeremy & Randles, Chris (Mob Home) (Del Tax)2172 S 9th St Coshocton $1,292.27 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 no bid/ no bid
2019CI0282 043-00002243-00 Knicely, Marilyn M aka Knicely, Marilyn R. (Del Tax)1509 E Main St Coshocton $4,408.05 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 Withdrawn
2019CI0013 043-00003205-00 Drown, William Todd living trust (Del Tax)553 Chestnut St Coshocton $16,785.45 6/26/2020 & 7/10/2020 no bid/Naki Property 

Group, LLC
$16,782.45

2019CI0327 003-00000876-23 Bucksbarg, Jason Scott 19271 CR 3 Warsaw $39,000 8/7/2020 & 8/21/2020 Plaintiff $26,000.00
2020CI0015 043-00005276-00 Redman, William (Deceased) 1412 S 13th St Coshocton $99,000 8/7/2020 & 8/21/2020 Tim Helbling $86,700.00
2020CI0032 004-00000415-00 

004-00000421-00 
004-00000428-00

Jahweh, LLC TR 29 Coshocton 8/7/2020 & 8/21/2020

Withdrawn
2020CI0079 043-00004359-00 

043-00001017-00
Vansickle, Michael A 603 & 611 S Lawn Coshocton $48,000 8/7/2020 & 8/21/2020 No Bid/Larry Endsley $13,000.00

2020CI0017 003-00000876-09 Radford, Leah C CR 3 Warsaw $27,000.00 10/9/2020 & 10/23/2020 Gregg Demetriadis $21,100.00
2020CI0089 013-14400170-01 Adams Mills Coal Co. (del tax) TR 306 Coshocton $23,603.36 10/9/2020 & 10/23/2020 Avery Holdings LLC $54,000.00
2019CI0442 043-00001015-00 

043-00001016-00
Marla R. Cummings 1710 Hay Ave Coshocton $69,000.00 11/20/2020 & 12/4/2020 No Bid / Plaintiff $45,000.00

2020 CI 0050 002-00000226-01 Poorman,Kristine  M. 27884 Tr. 242 Fresno       Withdrawn
2020 CI 0076 005-03300106-00- Beck, Benjamin           ( DEL TAX ) TR.25 Warsaw $2,584.65 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 Judy Medley $2,584.65
2020 CI 0078 005-00330033-01 Mullet, John  S            ( DEL TAX ) CR. 318 Blissfield $3,051.84 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 No Bid / No Bid
2020 CI 0074 017-00001243-01 Smucker, Mendy  L     ( DEL TAX ) 28328 CR.38 Coshocton $5,167.39 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 Matt Wright $51,000.00
2020 CI 0072 004-00000644-00 Hardy, Robert              ( DEL TAX ) 43031 CR, 27 Coshocton $6,401.95 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 David Bickel $24,000.00
2020 CI 0228 003-00000339-00 Cairati, Eugene            ( DEL TAX ) 22191 TR. 135 Coshocton $13,103.71 Withdrawn

2020 CI 0066 012-00000120-00 Shrimplin, Jeffrey  C,    ( DEL TAX ) 707 Franklin Ave. Conesville $2,044.24 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 Cheryl Slaughter $12,000.00
2020 CI 0134 043-00003244-00 Murphy, Sady Mae       ( DEL TAX ) 628 Cemetery Dr. Coshocton $5,649.09 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 Wess Reichman $14,000.00
2020 CI 0215 043-00003182-01 Schrock, Benjamin  W. ( DEL TAX ) 534 Vine St. Coshocton $5,226.99 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 MFM Building $16,600
2020 CI 0174 010-00000053-00 

010-00000849-01
Burns, Shatonya  J. 15265 CR. 274 Coshocton $30,000.00 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 Eric Baker $20,00.00

2020 CI 0144 029-00000300-00 Hickman, Gene            ( DEL TAX ) 56756 CR. 9 West Lafayette $1,934.63 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 Deana Vickrey $23,800.00
2020 CI 0144 029-00001279-00 Hickman, Gene            ( DEL TAX ) CR. 9 West Lafayette $1,824.09 4/30/2021 & 5/14/2021 Deana Vickrey $1,934.63
2021 CI 0014 020-00000247-00 First National Acceptance comp. 321 E. Main St. West Lafayette $7,159.74 5/28/2021 & 6/11/2021 Withdrawn
2020 CI 0260 035-00000756-00 Pickrell, Thomas  A. 226 Jackson St. Coshocton $4,650.66 5/28/2021 & 6/11/2021 Jerry Wright $10,500.00
2020 CI 0218 013-00000455-00 Hammond, Audra  L. 20874 Cr. 6 Coshocton $30,000.00 7/16/2021 & 8/6/2021 Betty Karr $36,000.00
2021 CI 0096 013-00001079-00 Casey, Kevin              (DEL TAX) 45660 CR 58 Coshocton $4,461.84 8/27/2021 & 9/10/2021 Withdrawn
2021 CI 0096 013-00001080-00 Casey, Kevin             (DEL TAX) CR 58 Coshocton $1,226.11 8/27/2021 & 9/10/2021 Withdrawn
2021 CI 0011 013-00001116-00 Burke, Holly L.           (DEL TAX) 46267 US 36 Coshocton $9,364.11 8/27/2021 & 9/10/2021 Withdrawn
2020 CI 0325 026000-8-6 Barkman, Andy R.      (DEL TAX) 38957 CR 33 Warsaw $1,472.89 8/27/2021 & 9/10/2021 No Bid / No Bid
2020 CI 0328 0170003-5 Erow, Donald & Sally    (DEL TAX) UNKNOWN UNKNOWN $3,323.75 8/27/2021 & 9/10/2021 No Bid / No Bid
2021 CI 0104 020131-1-0 Bussard, Kyle R.     (Mobile Home Only) 324 Fairview St West Lafayette $2,317.29 9/10/2021 & 9/24/2021 Withdrawn
2021 CI 0010 004-00000-901-00 Archand, Raymond Gordon Jr.  (Del. Tax)CR 49 Warsaw $2,168.96 9/10/2021 & 9/24/2021 David Bickel $3,100.00
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2021 CI 0069 040-00000023-03  

040-00000023-00  
040-00000203-00

O'Connell William S. 17845 SR 60 Warsaw $51,000.00 9/10/2021 & 9/24/2021 Plantiff $99,502.00


