CURRENT LIST OF FORFEITED PARCELS DATE: MAY, 2021 AT 10:30AM COSHOCTON COUNTY COURTHOUSE Last Updated: 9/21/2020
FAIR
LEGAL *08/24/2020 | , .| “LowesT | AcTUAL SUCCESSFUL BACK-UP Scheduled
# PARCEL # PREVIOUS OWNER | PROPERTY ADDRESS | [ o =20 | CASE NUMBER MVI-\ARLIGEET A DR | *COSTS b D vl DR STATUS et
Forfeited to Ohio; Offered at Auditor's Sale &
4 005-00029 Charleton L Seitz, et al 29626 CR 49 1991 Commodore | 4170104009 5,960 1,766.44 | 2,077.14 | 384358 received no bid 10/19/18 & 5/10/19 & May 2021
Clark - RV Mobile Home
10/18/19 & 9/18/20
Forfeited to Ohio; Offered at Auditor's Sale &
2 041-00069 Jeff Rine W”ff?s tCR 1"‘rv 19&1 Ef’mHmdme 18CI0037 2,330 596.66 116032 | 1,756.98 received no bid 10/19/18 & 5/10/19 & May 2021
ashington - oblle Home 10/18/19 & 9/18/20
Forfeited to Ohio; Offered at Auditor's Sale &
3 004-00215 David Knicely 43424 US 36 1987 Holly Park | 414 10106 2330 330.73 84226 | 1172.99 received no bid 10/19/18 & 5/10/19 & May 2021
Bethlehem - RV Mobile Home
10/18/19 & 9/18/20
. 22046 TR 1064 1968 Richmond Forfeited to Ohio; Offered at Auditor's Sale &
4 018-00163 Charles T Jarvis Lafayette - Ridgewood Mobile Home 18CI0025 1,890 sr2.11 2,097.01 | 1,890.00 received no bid 5/10/19 &10/18/19 & 9/18/20 May 2021
. 16789 SR 93 1970 Kirkwood Forfeited to Ohio; Offered at Auditor's Sale &
5 021-00042 Kenneth E Shingleton Linton - Ridgewood Mobile Home 18CI0039 2,000 790.37 1,166.64 1,957.01 received no bid 5/10/19 &10/18/19 & 9/18/20 May 2021
20530 CR 367 1978 Ritz Craft Forfeited to Ohio; Offered at Auditor's Sale &
6 031-00119 Donald E Bechtol Jr Pty RV oo Nz el 2018 CI 0269 2330 246.45 112392 | 1537037 e o o A e May 2021
IN LOT 45 PT . N o
7| 021-00000452-00 F A & Eliz M Stone _ TRaTT 21.5X65 18CI0442 140 237.94 212760 | 140.00 Forfeited to Ohio; Offered at Auditor's Sale & May 2021
Linton - Ridgewood received no bid 9/18/20
LINTON MILLS
8 038-00047 Ruth P Snodgrass 18356 County Road 6 | 1979 Bayview Mobile| 1460594 5,000 2,319.85 | 1,066.00 | 3,385.85 Forfeited to Ohio; Offered at Auditor's Sale & May 2021
Virginia - RV Home received no bid 9/18/20
9 035-00140 Jeremy Hough 2172 South 9th Street | 1965 Pontiac Chief | = 5419519364 1,890 63.61 TBA TBA Forfeited to Ohio May 2021
Tuscarawas - RV Mobile Home
. 381 South 9th Street | IN LOT 1035 42 X . .
10|  043-00001735-00 Nichole R Braxton | 201 S0 T SIESL | M40 02 DOG ade | 2018010405 8,680 1,104.28 TBA TBA Forfeited to Ohio May 2021
11 010-00117 Jerome Starner 18169 TR 284 1995 Flestwood | 419 ¢02g7 2,090 283.38 TBA TBA Forfeited to Ohio May 2021
Franklin - RV Mobile Home
12
KEY: *SUBJECT TO CHANGE * LAND SELECTED BY COSHOCTON COUNTY REUTILIZATION CORPORATION (CCLRC) THAT IT WISHES TO ACQUIRE IF MINIMAL BID NOT MET




